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Without much hope, we turned to
them—and in one of them, called
the Cave of the Star after a star-
shaped rock nearby, I had enough
adventure to last me a whole life-
time.

The Cave of the Star was a cave-
crawler’s dream: unexplored, mys-
terious, dark and ancient. Morelos
told us about it, then guided us to
the entrance: down the winding
mountainside into the valley of the
River Zapote, which is bounded on
two sides by sheer limestone cliffs
and on the third by a great hill, and
then along the banks of the rain-
swollen river. As we approached
the hill, the rushing noise of the
water gave way to a roaring sound.
Suddenly we passed through a cur-
tain of shrubbery, and stopped.

THE ROCK THAT
SWALLOWED THE RIVER
We were standing on a tiny ledge.

In the bare rock before us yawned a
huge, dark mouth, drinking in the
waters of the Rio Zapote as they

roared from a waterfall off to our
left. About 20 feet below us, and on
the other side of the water, was a
shelf—the only visible footpath into
the cave.

Ray de Saussure was the first to
speak, and he had to shout into
Bretz’s ear to make himself heard.

“It’ll take ropes. I’ve got a sixty-
five-foot rope ladder that at least
ought to get us down to the river.
But we still have to get across.”

Bretz nodded. It wasn’t going to
be easy. The water rushing along
below us was neither deep nor
wide, but it was very swift and tur-
bulent. From inside the cave came
enough additional noise to make it
evident that the stream remained
rough for quite a distance. A man
who lost his footing in that water,
especially a man burdened with
packs as we were, might be in seri-
ous trouble.

De Saussure rigged his nylon lad-
der, dangling it toward the stream,
then tested it. It groaned, but held.
Morelos grabbed the rope, swung

himself down. Then he jumped to
a great boulder in the center of the
stream—and was across. He stead-
ied the ladder and looked up en-
couragingly. Bonet started down,
quickly and sure-footedly—and
suddenly slipped. For a moment he
dangled from the ladder by one
hand, then dropped into the boil-
ing water below. For an instant
longer he teetered upright, trying
to keep his feet, and in that instant
Morelos leaned over, grabbed
Bonet’s arm in his strong brown
hand and hauled him out in one
sweeping motion, soaked but safe.

The rest of us descended more
carefully after that. We made it
without incident and for a few sec-
onds we stood there sizing up our
surroundings. To the right, out
through the mouth of the cave, we
could see the sunshine glinting off
the waterfall. In the other direction
lay the dark passageway of the
cave—and from somewhere in that
blackness there came a booming
roar, a noise so loud that it now
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