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is 275 meters deep and 400 meters
long.

The next day, Thomas took Joel
and Merrilee to the Kijahe to push
in Continuation 81. Some days of
rain had made the passages quite
wet. Encountering poor-quality
rock, they spent some time rigging
and looking for a drier route around
some wet pits. After finding a dry
meander, they stopped at the top of
a 20-meter pit, a good end point for
that trip. The next day they took
Stan with them to So On Jan to look
at some open leads in the Staub-
sauger. The first lead went down an
8-meter drop to 100 meters of pas-
sage to a flowstone choke with good
air. Stan completed two climbs that
ended at the base of a shaft esti-
mated to be 100 meters high, also
with good air.

During the final days of the ex-
pedition, Brad, Jeb, and Thomas
ventured into the region beyond
Nita Tii, an hour from basecamp
and on the upper trail to Tenango.
They tried to relocate the big pit that
had been found there by Roman
and Thomas in 1995. During their
overland survey, they located many

interesting pits, but did not find the
big one. After seventy-one surface
stations, they simply noted that
there is lots to check during another
expedition.

In all, the 1998 trip mapped 1.5
kilometers in eleven new caves and
added over 2.5 kilometers deep in
So On Jan, but the big extension
hoped for in the San José Borehole
fell a bit short of expectations. Hard
Rock Cave, which has a couple of
narrow spots, has very good airflow
and potential to go deep before per-
haps connecting into the main sys-
tem.

In late fall of 1998, a tragic caving
accident in Switzerland took the

life of Thomas Bitterli. He suc-
cumbed while attempting to save a
caver stranded on rope in a water-
fall. For his friends and the Cerro
Rabón project, this was an immense
loss. He had been the key organizer
and motivator for the project in re-
cent years, as well as one of the
strongest cavers. Needless to say,
many of us were too dismayed to
consider a trip in the following
spring. But we all agreed that

Thomas’s wish would be for us to
continue in the Cerro Rabón, and
so a small expedition was orga-
nized, mainly by Yvo Weidmann
and Catherine Perret in Oaxaca,
where they had been working with
the SERBO environmental office for
some fourteen months. Nathalie
Gumy and Laurent Déchanez with
their daughter Lea, Sybille Kilsch-
mann, Michel Bovey, and Jean-Marc
Jutzet joined the trip. Due to the
small crew, no deep trips were
made, but there were some adven-
tures in the bush. They also over-
saw a rain-water cistern project for
the community of San Martín that
was sponsored by the Swiss social
aid organization ARPE, the Associa-
tion pour la Réalisation de Projets
de’Entrainde. Initiated by the cavers
of the Cerro Rabón project, its in-
tention was to bring the most neutral
and general benefit to the town. The
cistern project was executed in a
serious, professional manner, but
the political ramifications were
greatly underestimated. In the end
it provided another target for the
growing political animosities among
the local people in San Martín. This
we did not expect.

Ventures into the forested karst
produced Live in Busch, a new pit
discovered very near the So On Jan
area and sporting another volumi-
nous drop, of 220 meters. The small
Kijahe valley now has four two-
hundred-meter pits, all within 100
meters of each other.

A big effort was made to venture
into the Lost City valley again. The
forest camp was reached with a 200-
meter rope, and a trip to the deep
pit found by Roman and David in
1995 was made. Unfortunately, they
found when they got there that a
group of Americans had beat them
to it, a great disappointment due to
lack of communication between dif-
ferent expeditions. On the bright
side, though, maybe they were
lucky, because the pit turned out to
be 260 meters deep. No one noticed
burned areas, so apparently the
moist deciduous trees that grow
low in the Lost City valley were not
disturbed by the fires of 1998, much
to their relief. They later learned
that the fire had moved very quick-
ly, above the ground, and mostly on
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