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the surface between 10:00 and noon.
My health being much improved
over the past five days, I feel well
enough to walk in the easy horizon-
tal parts of the cave. In the afternoon
I am accompanied to the base of the
pits. I manage so well on my own
two legs that I pass over some
rigged sections without assistance.
As my state improves, I feel increas-
ingly embarrassed. I begin feeling
guilty; a walking casualty is not
normal, and it will appear ridicu-
lous if I surface cured. My concern
is reinforced when I hear of news
in the Mexican media about trea-
sure in the pit, hidden explosives,
espionage, a false casualty who
does not want to come out—in fact,
all that one can invent from scanty
information coming out of the zone
controlled by the soldiers.

On the surface, tension rises be-
cause of the number of people, their
fatigue, and the difficulties of
communication due to both the lan-
guage and cultural differences and
control of information by the Mexi-
can organizations. The Canadian
Embassy offers support in dealing
with authorities, and a representa-
tive visits the site by helicopter. This
same person brings batteries, food,
and water, which are immediately
collected for use by the Cruz Roja.
The complex situation is explained
to him, and he promises to help, but
must leave quickly because of the
bad flying weather. All learn that
the eight Cruz Roja members miss-
ing since yesterday had simply not
entered the cave without telling
anyone.

In the afternoon, General Juarez
of the Mexican army arrives and
takes control of the operation. He
cleans house, sending home all
people not essential for the rescue.
There remain only about fifteen
civil servants. Nothing more is done

without his authorization, includ-
ing entering the cave.

About 5:00 P.M., two Quebec
cavers arrive at the base of the pits
with the soldiers they are escorting.
At 6:00, the cavers at –200 meters
in the Milky Way are alerted by ra-
dio that an “elite group” of soldiers
is heading for the entrance with in-
adequate equipment. Their mission
is to enlarge the passage with ham-
mers, but they never reach their
objective, being stopped by the
third pit.

I insist that I can pass through the
narrow zone without the stretcher,
but the risk of aggravating my inju-
ries is mentioned. The decision is
entrusted to the doctor, who gives
his consent, and I set off at about
5:00 P.M.

DAY 7, DECEMBER 29. During the
night I am hoisted in the stretcher
up two pits to the narrow area,
where I leave the stretcher. Since I
feel well, I suggest a test at the next
small pit, and I am hoisted to the
top without the stretcher, sus-
pended in my seat harness, slack-
ened to avoid pressure on my
wounds and give a higher point of
attachment.

It is 4:30 A.M. The plan was to biv-
ouac and wait for a team change to
hoist my stretcher to the outside.
Now I learn that there are no more
fresh rescuers on the surface, be-
cause they spent the night rigging
the series of pits. I would have to
wait twenty-four hours. I therefore
convince some companions to con-
tinue in the same manner, without
the stretcher. Four cavers volunteer
for this operation on the condition
that we eat first. A good freeze-
dried meal is eaten, and we set out
again a little after 7:00, after the few
remaining obstacles have been
rigged. We soon arrive at the part
of the cave that has been carefully
rerigged for rescue, and from there
at –150 meters our progress accel-
erates.

The elite military group from the
day before is soon reached. They
offer their assistance, but cannot be
very effective because of their lack
of experience in vertical caving.
They are sympathetic, but do not
seem to be aware of the dangers

specific to the underground. Most
of them are not wearing helmets
and do not have ascending devices,
so they are stuck at the bottom.
They descended by attaching their
long 12-millimeter rope to a natu-
ral anchor, making it rub a little
everywhere along the multi-pit
descent, dislodging stones that ca-
reened down the pits. They had
stopped at the third pit due to lack
of rope. Fortunately, 12-millimeter
rope tolerates abrasion. They ac-
company my ascent by free-climbing
a pit. Fortunately, somebody brings
them ascending gear, so we con-
tinue with a quieter conscience.
Outside, we are met by a score of
other soldiers at about 1:00 P.M.

No cavers are present at the en-
trance because the soldiers blocked
off the area when they heard that
my arrival was imminent. After al-
lowing me to walk, closely escorted,
halfway to the base camp, they put
me on a stretcher to carry me to my
tent, where their doctor examines
me. Then I was left to spend some
time with Sandra, and I was helped
to pack by several buddies. The sol-
diers accompany us to vehicles,
where we join Bastien, whose ankle
needs care, and Claude. In less than
two hours, the four of us, chased by
reporters, are taken to Tezonapa,
where a twenty-four seat helicop-
ter awaits us on the soccer field.
From there, we fly to the military
hospital in Puebla, where Bastien
and I are further examined. The
doctor diagnoses a sprained right
hip and a cutaneous infection. He
prescribes me antibiotics and anti-
inflammatory drugs and gives me
my leave. Bastien’s sprain is consid-
ered to be rather severe, and his
ankle is put in a cast. Mrs. Margaret
Félisiak of the Canadian Embassy
comes to join us at the hospital,
helps deal with the formalities, and
takes us all to a hotel in Mexico City.

Upon examination in Quebec on
January 10, I find that, in addi-

tion to the sprained hip that pre-
vented me from raising my right
leg and my many contusions and
scratches, some infected, I also
suffered from a dorsal sprain, a
crushed vertebra, and torn muscles
in my back. It is believed that I will
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