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submerged coastal entrances. Many
outstanding biologists and explor-
ers have studied these caves since
the early 1980s. However, much
survey and exploration work in the
1990s remains unaccounted for, and
we hope to be able to report more
accurate facts on these two caves as
they become available. (Cueva
Aerolito was reported to be over 18
kilometers in length in Underwater
Speleology, volume 27 number 4, in
an article by Tim McMahon. We are
seeking confirmation of this length.)

Diving in Cueva Quebrada re-
quires an official permit from the
Chankanaab Park office. Cavers
applying for this permit must pro-
duce a Full Cave certification card.
Exploration in Quebrada is limited
to scientific purposes.

German Yanez Mendoza, a resi-
dent caver on Cozumel, provided
us with these descriptions of inland
(on the island) underwater caves:

Cenote Bambu, length 60 meters,
depth 50 meters. Cenote Bambu
was explored in spring 2000 and is
very similar to the Cenote Tres
Potrillos . Maximum visibility in
this classic sink is 3 meters. It ap-
pears that the initial entrance gal-
lery is huge, yet poor visibility
makes it extremely difficult to fully
explore this deep cave. Further-
more, the floor of the cave is very
deep and heavy silt, which makes
it nearly impossible to tie off sur-
vey guideline.

Cenote Chu-Ha, upstream 240
meters to 38 meters depth, down-
stream 300 meters to 18 meters
depth. This cenote is closed to the
public due to the presence of ar-
chaeological artifacts, and it is also
surrounded by very private com-
mercial property. About nine large
Mayan artifacts were recovered
from this cenote. According to
INAH, these artifacts are about four
hundred years old. The most inter-
esting quality of these artifacts is
their style, which is exclusive to the
Maya of Cozumel.

Cenote Tres Potrillos, 94 meters
long, depth of sink 38 meters, depth
of tunnel 15 meters. This cave was
discovered in late 1998. Its entrance
is a series of minor restrictions that
open into a vary large chamber at –9
meters. Without a daylight zone,

the main chamber and its one
branching passage are rich in spe-
leothems. Farthest penetration into
the tunnel is 60 meters. This cave is
on private property and has an en-
trance fee. Source: Jim Coke in
www.caves .org/project /qrss/
cozumel.htm.

Exploration in Sistema Sac Actun,
17078 meters long, has revealed
connections with Cenote Naval to
the east and Cenote Calimba to the
northwest. Explorations with side-
mount techniques have added
nearly 13 kilometers to the cave
since 1993. A southeast passage
from Naval seems likely to connect
to Sistema Abejas (9742 meters),
but further survey efforts within
Cenote Naval are restricted by or-
der of a nearby military base. Source:
Jim Coke.

In November 1999, three British
cave divers visited the Yucatan Pen-
insula. It was basically a tourist trip,
but a British diver’s observation
might be useful: “Visitors to the
area should be aware that the heavy
American influence leads to some
unfamiliar practices. Lines are
nearly always white, and hence dif-
ficult to see against calcite walls and
floors, marked in feet, and only 2
millimeters thick. Caves are not
lined to the surface. Should you be
returning to the entrance after dark,
you may not be able to see the exit.
Within the caves, rather than clearly
marked line junctions, side pas-
sages and continuations are entered
by means of a ‘jump,’ where divers
have to join the fixed lines with
their own. There is an ambiguous

arrowing system where lines are
arrowed, but [the arrows] do not
necessarily point to the exit. This
has inevitably led to some unpleas-
ant incidents in the region in recent
years.” Source: Martyn Farr, Cave
Diving Group [UK] Newsletter 135,
April 2000.

A cave-diving expedition orga-
nized by Christian Thomas and
consisting of nine French and three
Portuguese divers visited Quintana
Roo in February 1998 and discov-
ered and mapped 5.5 kilometers of
new passage, including extending
the underground rivers of Xeil-Ha
and Xcaret in the biological reserve.
Source: Regards 33, 1998, page 36.

In October 2000, Hervé Gordon,
Christophe Le Maillot, and I made
the first exploration dives in re-
cently discovered Cenote Camino.
Tanks needed to be lowered by
rope, and a tree was used to climb
down to the water. Rain made for a
muddy entrance and had tainted
the surface water with tannin. The
water cleared below 2.5 meters, and
I began to lay line heading north-
west. I quickly came upon another
entrance and tried to push around
the muddy breakdown. Christophe
and Hervé concentrated on the east-
ern fortifications, trying to find a
downstream opening. Decorated
walls pushed them north and to the
same breakdown. A fissure hinted
at deeper cave being present, but it
was too narrow, even in our side-
mount configuration. After forty
minutes, we left the water with 2500
psi in our tanks. Although disap-
pointing in size, this new cave is
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